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Middlesex Regional Educational Services Commission
Board of Directors Meeting
December 19, 2014

RESOLUTION:

That the Board of Directors approve the revision of the New Jersey Digital Readiness
for Learning Assessment Project (NJ DRLAP) - Broadband Component Wide Area
Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative RFP #MRESC 14/15-26, as
attached.




New Jersey Digital Readiness for Learning and Assessment Project- BroadL Component- Wide Area Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative
Attachment 1- Pricing Spreadsheets
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1 Comcast
- — : A Enar EAHER : o . T -
: : Transport Internet I Sumof. | Total Cnsts All
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4 -——;—
5 Northeastern Region i
6 Alpine Board of Education 030080 Ethernet 7/1/2015 $ 5 7
7 | D2 [Bayonne Board 170220 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 N/A 7/1/2018 S - H#VALUE!
8 | D3 |Belleville Public School District 000250 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 S -15 -
9 | D4 |Bergen Arts and Science Charter Schq806013 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7(1/2015 s i :
10| DS |[Bloomfield School District 130410 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72( S 132,829.83
11| D6 |Bloomingdale Board of Education |310420 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ - 5 -1s -
12| D7 [Boonton Public Schools 270450 Ethernet 300 300 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1 s -
13| D8 |Boonton Township School District |270460 Ethernet 300 300 36 7/1/2015 | S - S -|s -
14| D9 |Burch Charter School of Excellence [806022 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -1s -
15| D10 (Butler Board of Education 270630 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S 4 S -1s 4
16 | D11 {Caldwell/West Caldwell 130660 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | S 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59( S 90,885.30
17 | D12 |Clifton Board of Education 310900 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -8 -
18 | D13 |Cliffside Park School District 030890 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | $ - S -8 -
19| D14 |Denville School District 271090 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1s -
20 | D15 |Dumont Board of Education 031130 Ethernet 300 300 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -1 -
21| D16 |East Orange Community Charter Sch{806410 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| § 132,829.83
22| D17 |East Orange School District 131210 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S 3,582.25 | $ 3,689.72| § 88,553.22
23| D18 |Elmwood Park Public Schools Districj 031345 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 N/A 7/1/2019 | § =1 IS - #VALUE!
24| D19 |Englewood Cliffs School District 001380 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1 s -
25| D20 |Englewood Public schools 137003 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -1S -
26 | D21 |Englewood Public schools 137003 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 5 $ - s -
27 | D22 |Fair Lawn Board of Education 031450 Ethernet 500 500 2 7/1/2017 | § - S -1s -
28| D23 |Fairfield Board of Education 131465 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | § 998.58 | § 1,028.54| S  12,342.45
29| D24 |Fairfield Board of Education 131465 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | § 998.58 | S 1,028.54| §  12,342.45
30| D25 |Florham Park School District 271530 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S - S ol 3 b
31| D26 |Glen Ridge Public Schools 131750 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25 | $ 3,689.72| S 132,829.83
32| D27 |Glen Rock Board of Education 031760 Ethernet 300 300 36 7/1/2015 | - S -8 -
33 | D28 [Hackensack Board of Education 031860 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | $ - S -1s -
34 | D29 |Hanover Park Regional High School [[271990 Ethernet 300 300 24 7/1/2016 | S - 5 -5 -
35| D30 |Hanover Township Public Schools  |272000 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1s -
36 | D31 |Hasbrouck Heights School District  [032080 Ethernet 50 50 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1 S -
37 | D32 [Haworth Public School 032090 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | - S 1S %
38 | D33 |Hawthorne Public Schools 1312100 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -15 “
39| D34 |Hillsdale School District 032180 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | $ = S SIS =
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New Jersey Digital Readiness for Learning and Assessment Project- BroadL

Component- Wide Area Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative
Attachment 1- Pricing Spreadsheets
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40 | D35 |Ho-Ho-Kus Board of Education 032200 Ethernet 20 20 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -|s -
41| D36 |Hudson County Schools of Technolog 172295 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1S -
42 | D37 |Irvington Board of Education 132330 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | § 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| $ 132,829.83
43| D38 |Jersey City School District 172390 Ethernet 10,000 10,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 12,818.00 [ $ 13,202.54| $ 475,291.44
44| D39 |Jersey City School District 172390 Ethernet 10,000 10,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 12,818.00 | $ 13,202.54| S 475,291.44
45| D40 (Jersey City School District 172380 Ethernet 10,000 10,000 36 7/1/2015 | 5  12,818.00 | S 13,20254| S 475,291.44
46 | D41 |lersey City School District 172390 Ethernet 10,000 10,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 12,818.00 | § 13,202.54| S 475,291.44
47 | D42 |Joseph Kushner Hebrew Academy/Rq 142730 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | $ - $ al S :
48| D43 [Kinnelon Public Schools 272460 Ethernet 250 250 24 7/1/2016 | $ - S -8 =
49| D44 |Leonia Board of Education 032620 Ethernet 200 200 12 7(1/2017 | S - S -1s -
50| D45 |Lincoln Park Board of Education 272650 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -5 -
51| D46 |Little Ferry Public Schools 032710 Ethernet 500 500 N/A 7/1/2018 | S - S = H#VALUE!
52 | D47 |Livingston Public Schools 132730 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72( S 132,829.83
53 | D48 |Ma'ayanot High School for Girls 045150 Ethernet 300 300 24 7/1/2016 | S - L -1S -
54 | D49 |Marion P Thomas Charter Schoal 007210 Ethernet 800 800 12 7/1/2017 | S - 5 -5 -
55| D50 |Maywood Public School 033060 Ethernet 300 300 24 7/1/2016 | = $ SIS z
56 | D51 |Mendham Borough Schools 273090 Ethernet 200 200 24 7/1/2016 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05[ $  35,113.28
57 | D52 |Midland Park Public Schools 033170 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -1S &
58 [ D53 |Millburn Township Public Schools 133190 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| 5§ 132,829.83
59| D54 |Montclair Kimberley Academy (MKA] 143310 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | $ 3,582.25| § 3,689.72| S  88,553.22
60| D55 |Montclair Kimberley Academy (MKA] 143310 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S 3,582.25| S 3,689.72| S 88,553.22
61| D56 |Montclair Kimberley Academy (MKA] 143310 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S 3,582.25 | $ 3,689.72| $§  88,553.22
62 | D57 |Montville Township Public Schools 273340 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | $ - S -1's -
63 | D58 |Marris Hills Regional District 273370 Ethernet 500 500 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -1 s -
64 | D59 |Morris Plains School District 273380 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -5 -
65| D60 |Morris School District 273385 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S - S -1 s -
66 | D61 |Mount Olive Township Board of Eduq273450 Ethernet 700 700 24 7/1/2016 | S - 5 2 -
67 | D62 |Mountain Lakes School District 273460 Ethernet 300 300 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -5 -
68 | D63 |New Hope School 320900 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ = s =i|1s -
69 | D64 |Newark Educators' Community Char{ 806029 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -1 s -
70| D65 |The Newark Public Schools 133570 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1 s -
71| D66 |The Newark Public Schools 133570 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | & & s -1s -
72| D67 |North Arlington Public Schools 033600 Ethernet 250 250 12 7/1/2017 | § 1,602.00 | 1,650.06| S  19,800.72
73| D68 [North Bergen School District 173610 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | $ - 5 -5 -
74 | D69 |Northern Higlands Regional High Sch{033700 Ethernet 300 300 24 7/1/2016 | $ - S o b &
75| D70 |Northvale/Northvale Public School |033730 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | $ - S -5 -
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New Jersey Digital Readiness for Learning and Assessment Project- Broadt

Component- Wide Area Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative
Attachment 1- Pricing Spreadsheets
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The Board of Education of the Townd 133750 Ethernet 7/1/2015 | § 5 5
77| D72 |Oakland Board of Education 033760 Ethernet 150 150 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -8 -
78 | D73 |Oradell School District 033870 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S - S -|s -
79 | D74 |Orange Public Schools 133880 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -8 -
80| D75 |Paramus Board of Education 033930 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 1§ £ S -1s -
81| D76 |Parsippany-Troy Hills Township Scho{273950 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | § - S o L -
82| D77 |Pascack Valley Regional High School |033960 Ethernet 300 300 24 7/1/2016 | § - S -1s -
83| D78 |Pascack Valley Regional High School |033960 Ethernet 500 500 24 7/1/2016 | § - S -1s -
84 | D79 |Passaic Arts and Science Charter Sch{806080 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -1 s -
85 | D80 |Passaic City Public Schools 313970 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | § 2 S -1 -
86 | D81 |Passaic City Public Schools 313970 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 | 7/1/2015 | $ B [ o -
87| D82 |Passaic Valley Regional High School 313990 Ethernet 500 500 24 7/1/2016 | $ - S -1 S -
88 | D83 |Paterson Arts and Science Charter Sd 006096 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1s -
89 | D84 |Paterson Charter School for Science |807503 Ethernet 100 100 24 | 7/1/2016 | S - S -1 s -
90 | D85 |Paterson Public Schools 004010 Ethernet 10,000 10,000 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -8 -
91| D86 |Paulo Freire Charter School 806090 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | $§ - $ -|1's s
92 | D87 |Ramapo Indian Hills Regional High 54034300 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S - S H{ES -
93| D88 |Ramsey School District 034310 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -1s -
94 | D89 |Ridgefield Park BOE 034380 Ethernet 300 300 12 7/1/2017 | & - S -1 -
95| D90 |Ridgewood Public Schools 034390 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | § - S -8 -
96 | D91 |Ridgewood Public Schools 034390 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -1S -
97 | D92 |Ridgewood Public Schools 034390 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | $ - s Bl -
98 | D93 |Ringwaood School District 314400 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S el 5
99 | D94 [River Dell Regional School District 034405 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1S -
100| D95 |River Vale Public Schools 034430 Ethernet 150 150 36 7/1/2015 |'S - S -1 s —
101] D96 |Rockaway Township 274490 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S - S o B -
102| D97 |Roseland School District 134530 Ethernet 50 50 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -8 -
103| D98 |Roxbury Township Public Schools  |274560 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S - i
104| D99 |Rutherford Public Schools 004600 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | S 2,451.06 | 2,524.59( § 90,885.30
105| D100|Saddle Brook School District 034610 Ethernet 295 295 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1 -
106| D101|Secaucus Public School District 174730 Ethernet 200 200 24 7/1/2016 | $ 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| S 35,113.28
107| D102 |South Orange Maplewood Board of §134900 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -1s -
108| D103 |Tenafly Public Schools 035160 Ethernet 500 500 24 7/1/2016 | S = S - s i
109| D104|The Calais School 288215 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § - S EihE) 5
110] D105 |The Children's Institute-High School [148389 Ethernet 150 150 12 7/1/2017 | § 1,602.00 | S 1,650.06| S 19,800.72
111] D106|The Moriah School 031370 Ethernet 300 300 36 7/1/2015 | S = 5 -|s =
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New Jersey Digital Readiness for Learning and Assessment Project- BroadL Component- Wide Area Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative
Attachment 1- Pricing Spreadsheets
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D107|Union City Board of Education 175240 Ethernet 7/1/2016 | § S S
113| D108|Unity Charter School 808050 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S = S =lis 5
114| D109 |Upper Saddle River Board of Educati{035330 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | § - S -1 S -
115| D110|Washington Township Schools 275520 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -1 s -
116| D111{Wayne Township Public Schaols 315570 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S5 bt 3
117} D112 |West Milford School District 315650 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | § = S o ) i
118| D113 |West New York Board of Education |175670 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1 =
119| D114 |West Orange Public Schools 135680 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 1 S - S -5 -
120| D115 |Westwood Regional School District |035755 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 1§ o s -1 s A
121| D116|Wharton School District 275770 Ethernet 50 50 36 7/1/2015 | S - S -8 &
122| D117 | Wyckoff School district 035920 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | S = S -1'S "
| 123 0 pstern Regio Ethernet
124| D118|Belvidere School District 410280 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | § 1,02854| §  37,027.35
125| D119|Byram Township School District 370640 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1s -
126| D120|Fredon Township Elementary School|371630 Ethernet 25 25 24 7/1/2016 | $ - S -1S -
127| D121 |Frelinghuysen Township School Distr{411670 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S - S -8 -
128| D122 |Great Meadows Regional School Dist| 411785 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -|s -
129| D123 |Hampton Township School District |371980 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | $ - S -| S -
130| D124 |High Point Regional School District |372165 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| §  37,027.35
131| D125|Kittatinny Regional School District 372465 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | $ - S -1s -
132| D126|Lopatcong Township Schoal District |412790 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -5 -
133| D127 |Mansfield Township Elementary Schq412970 Ethernet 50 50 36 7/1/2015 | S 709.33 | S 730.61| S  26,301.96
134| D128 |Montague Elementary School 373300 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -18 -
135] D129 |Newton Public Schools 373590 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | § - $ o 2
136| D130|North Warren Regional School Distrig413675 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -5 -
137| D131 |Oxford Township Board of Education|413890 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | 5 1,028.54( S 37,027.35
138| D132 |Phillipsburg School School 004100 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | § - S -1s -
139| D133|Ridge and Valley Charter School 807727 Ethernet 50 50 36 7/1/2015 | § 7 S ol b T
140| D134 |Sparta Board of Education 374960 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | $ - S -5 -
141| D135|Stillwater Township Board of Educati{ 375040 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | $ - S -1s o
142| D136|Sussex County Educational Services (375105 Ethernet 20 20 36 7/1/2015 | $§ - ) -8 -
143| D137 |Wallkill Valley Regional High School |375435 Ethernet 100 100 12 | 7/1/2017 | $ - s -1s i
144| D138|Warren County Special Services Scho 415450 Ethernet 50 50 36 | 7/1/2015 | $ 5 9 R RS 5
145 entral Regio Ethernet
146| D139 |Asbury Park School District 250100 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1 s 5
147| D140|The Barack Obama Green Charter Hig 806033 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54| §  37,027.35
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New Jersey Digital Readiness for Leamning and Assessment Project- BroadL
Attachment 1- Pricing Spreadsheets

Somponent- Wide Area Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative
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Belmar School District 250270 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 7/1/2016 | S S S

149| D142 |Berkeley Heights School District 390310 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | § 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| § 132,829.83
150| D143 |Bethlehem Township School District [ 190370 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | § 3,582.25 | $ 3,689.72| S 132,829.83
151| D144 |Branchburg Township School District} 350510 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54|'5"137,027.35
152| D145 |Bridgewater-Raritan Regional School| 350555 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -ls -

153| D146 |Carteret Board Of Education 230750 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | S 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59( §  90,885.30
154| D147 |Clinton Township School District 190920 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | $ 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| S 44,276.61
155| D148|Colts Neck Township School District [250945 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -|s -

156| D149|East Brunswick Public Schools 231170 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59( §  30,295.10
157| D150 | East Brunswick Public Schools 231170 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S 2,451.06 | S 2,524.59( S 30,295.10
158| D151 |East Windsor Regional School Distric| 211245 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| §  44,276.61
159| D152 |Elizabeth Public Schools 391320 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S - S -['s =

160| D153 | Fair Haven Board of Education 251440 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | § 998.58 | S 1,028.54| $ 12,342.45
161| D154 |Franklin Township Board of Educatio|351610 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | § 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| S 44,276.61
162| D155 |Franklin Township School 191600 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.721 S 132,829.83
163| D156 [Freehold Borough School District 251640 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 S 3,582.25 | 5 3,689.72| S 132,829.83
164| D157 |Freehold Township Board of Educati| 251660 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -1 -

165| D158 |Green Brook Township Public School|351810 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | § = S -|s -

166| D159 |Hatikvah International Academy Cha|608041 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| S 132,829.83
167| D160 |High Bridge School District 192140 Ethernet 50 50 36 7/1/2015 | § 709.33 | § 730.61| S 26,301.96
168| D161 |Highland Park Board of Education  [232150 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | $ - S - S -

169| D162 |Hillsborough Township Board of Edu{352170 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | $ 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| S  88,553.22
170| D163 |Hope Academy Charter School 806740 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1S -

171| D164 |Hopewell Valley Regional School Dis{ 212280 Ethernet 350 350 36 7/1/2015 | $ 2,141.34 | § 2,205.58( §  79,400.89
172| D165 |Howell Township Public Schools 252290 Ethernet 10,000 10,000 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -3 -

173| D166|Hunterdon Central Regional High ScH132300 Ethernet 300 300 24 7/1/2016 | S 1,799.58 | S 1,853.57| & 44,485.62
174| D167 |Hunterdon Learning Center 208258 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
175| D168|International Charter School of Trent 806810 Ethernet 85 85 36 7/1/2015 | S 99858 | S 1,028.54( §  37,027.35
176| D168 |Jamesburg Board of Education 232370 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | $ 998.58 | S 1,02854( S  12,342.45
177| D170|Keanshurg School District 252400 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| S 132,829.83
178| D171 |Keyport Board of Education 252430 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| $§ 132,829.83
179| D172 [Lawrence Township Public Schools |215280 Ethernet 300 300 12 7/1/2017 | S 1,799.58 | § 1,853.57| §  22,242.81
180| D173 |Lebanon Township School District 192600 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | § 1,028.54| $ 37,027.35
181| D174 |Long Branch Board of Education 252770 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | § 3,582.25 | $ 3,689.72 & 132,829.83
182| D175|Manalapan-Englishtown Regional Scl| 252920 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 2 S -| s -

183| D176|Manasquan School District 252930 Ethernet 150 150 36 7/1/2015 | S - S -8 -
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New Jersey Digital Readiness for Learning and Assessment Project- Broadk

Attachment 1- Pricing Spreadsheets

Component- Wide Area Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative
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184| D177 [Marlboro Township Board of Educati| 253030 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -1s -
185| D178 |Mercer County Special Services Scho{213103 Ethernet 400 400 36 7/1/2015 | § - S -1s =
186| D179 |Mercer County Technical Schools 003105 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -1s =
187| D180 |Metuchen School District 233120 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1s -
188| D181 |Middlesex Regional Educational Serv| 233145 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | $ - 5 -8 -
189| D182 |Middlesex Borough Public Schools |233140 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S - S 18 -
190] D183 |Middletown Twp School District 253160 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | $ 2,451.06 | $ 2,524.59| S 90,885.30
191] D184 |Monroe Township Board of Educatio| 233290 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| S 44,276.61
192| D185 | Morris-Union Jointure Commission |[003395 Ethernet 75 75 24 7/1/2016 | § - S -1S -
193] D186 |Mountainside School District 393470 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 24,684.90
194{ D187 [New Brunswick Board of Education [233530 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1s -
195| D188 |New Providence 393560 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| S  88,553.22
196| D189 |New Road Schools of New Jersey/Pai{248346 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1 s :
197| D190 |New Road Schools of New Jersey/So1| 368254 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | § 1,028.54| §  37,027.35
198| D191 |North Brunswick Township School Dij003620 Ethernet 950 950 24 7/1/2016 | S = S -1s =
199| D192 [North Hunterdon-Voorhees Regional| 193660 Ethernet 300 300 12 7/1/2017 | $ 1,799.58 | $ 1,853.57| §  22,242.81
200| D193 |0ld Bridge Township School District | 233845 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | § a S -5 -
201| D194 |Perth Amboy Public Schools 234090 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| S 88,553.22
202| D195|Princeton Charter School 807540 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25| S 3,689.72| § 132,829.83
203| D196|Princeton Child Development Instituf 224255 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25| S 3,689.72| § 132,829.83
204| D197 |Princeton Public Schools 214255 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | S 2,451.06 | 5 2,524,591 $  90,885.30
205| D198 | Public Schools of Edison Township (231290 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| S  44,276.61
206| D199 |Rahway Public School District 394290 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | $ 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59| 5 90,885.30
207| D200|Readington Township School District{001022 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59| S 30,295.10
208| D201 |Red Bank Borough Board of Educatio 254360 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 [ $ 2,451.06 | 2,524.59] § 90,885.30
209| D202 |Red Bank Regional High School Distri{004365 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S  24,684.90
210| D203 |Rumson Board of Education 254570 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | & 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| S  44,276.61
211| D204 |Rutgers Preparatory School 361610 Ethernet 150 150 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | 5 1,463.05[ S  52,669.92
212| D205 |Sayreville Public Schoals 234660 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S - $ -8 +
213| D206|Scotch Plains-Fanwood 394670 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $  3,582.25| % 3,689.72| § 132,826.83
214| D207 |Somerset Hills Regional School Distri{354815 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S 2,451.06 | S 2,52459| §  30,295.10
215| D208]South Amboy Public Schools 231220 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ A LE -1s -
216| D209 |South Brunswick Township School Di[ 234860 Ethernet 200 200 12 7/1/2017 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| S  17,556.64
217| D210|South Hunterdon regional School Dig 191376 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | § 1,463.05| S 52,669.92
218| D211|South Plainfield Board of Education 234910 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | § 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59] §  30,295.10
219| D212 |South River Public Scheools 234920 Ethernet 150 150 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | § 1,463.05| $ 52,669.92

Copyright Dellicker Strategies Page 6 of 10 Proprietary



New Jersey Digital Readiness for Learning and Assessment Project- Broadt

Component- Wide Area Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative
Attachment 1- Pricing Spreadsheets

Copyright Dellicker Strategies

Page 7 of 10

Al B | ¢ R S T I x Y] AC | AG AH
1 Comcast
2 Internet.Gre h ; :
Transport Internet s Service Monthly Sum of Tota qsts'A!r-;
1D# District/Organization Name | i District | Type of Service ' = Bandwidth Bandwidth f (Months) [ Accept Mo T UGt Monthly Services Full :
i Code (Mbps) (Mbps) ‘ Dat g Recurring Costs!| Term o
D213 |Tewksbury Township School District | 195180 Ethernet 250 250 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,799.58 | § 1,853.57| S 66,728.43
221| D214|Village Charter School 808140 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54 §  37,027.35
222| D215 | Tinton Falls Board of Education 255185 Ethernet 300 300 36 7/1/2015 [ ¢  1,799.58 | $ 1,853.57| $  66,728.43
223| D216 |Township of Ocean Board of Educati{253810 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -5 -
224| D217 |Township of Union Public Schools (395290 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | $ 1,420.44 | $§ 1,463.05| $ 52,669.92
225| D218|Trenton Public Schools 215210 Ethernet 10,000 10,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 12,818.00( S 13,202.54| S 475,291.44
226| D219 |Union County Educational Services C]395245 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | § 998.58 | § 1,028.54| S 12,342.45
227| D220|Union County Vocational-Technical 395260 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59] 5 90,885.30
228| D221|Upper Freehold Regional School Dist{ 255310 Ethernet 300 300 12 7/1/2017 | S - S -ls 4
229| D222 | Wall Township Public Schools 255420 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | § - S -1s -
230| D223 |Warren Township School District 355470 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S - S -|s -
231| D224|Watchung Borough |355540 Ethernet 50 50 36 | 7/1/2015 | S - S -|s -
232| D225 |Watchung Hills Regional High School|355550 | Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S - S -5 -
233| D226 |West Long Branch School District 255640 Ethernet 200 200 12 7/1/2017 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| S 17,556.64
234| D227 |West Windsor-Plainsboro Regional 5215715 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72] § 132,829.83
235| D228 | Westfield Public Schools 395730 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | $ 3,689.72| S 44,276.61
236| D229{Woodbridge Township 235850 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | § 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| § 88,553.22
237| D334 |Hazlet Township Public Schools 252105 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 N/A 7/1/2018 | S 3,582.25 | $ 3,689.72 #VALUE!
238 Southern Region i Ethernet 72,760 72,760
239| D230|Absecon School District 010010 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| $ 37,027.35
240| D231|Alloway School District 330060 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | § 1,028.54| $ 37,027.35
241| D232 | Atlantic City Board of Education 010110 Ethernet 300 300 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,799.58 | § 1,853.57| § 66,728.43
242| D233 |Atlantic County Special Services Schq 010125 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| $ 52,669.92
243| D234 |Atlantic County Vocational School Di{010120 Ethernet 500 500 24 7/1/2016 | S 2,451.06 | S 2,524.59] S 60,590.20
244| D235|Audubon Public School 070150 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | § 1,028.54| §  37,027.35
245| D236|Barrington 070190 Ethernet 300 300 36 7/1/2015 | § 1,799.58 | § 1,853.57| S 66,728.43
246| D237|Bay Head Board of Eduction 290210 Ethernet 20 20 36 7/1/2015 | S 510.86 | S 526.19| § 18,942.69
247| D238|Beach Haven School 290230 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 99858 | $ 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
248| D239|Bellmawr Board of Education 070260 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
249| D240|Berkeley Township Board of Educatid 290320 Ethernet 200 200 12 7/1/2017 | S 1,420.44 | § 1,463.05( S 17,556.64
250| D241|Bordentown Regional School District| 000475 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | S 2,451.06 | S 2,524.59| S 90,885.30
251| D242 |Brick Township Board of Education [290530 | Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | & 3,689.72( S  44,276.61
252| D243|Brick Township Board of Education [250530 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 1 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| § 44,276.61
253| D244 |Bridgeton School District 000540 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| S  44,276.61
254| D245 |Camden City School District 070680 Ethernet 2,000 2,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 4,803.33| S 4,947.43| S 59,369.16
255| D246|Camden City School District 070680 Ethernet 2,000 2,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 4,803.33 | S 4,947.43| § 59,369.16
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256| D247 |Chatsworth Elementary School 055890 Ethernet 3,000 3,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 5,965.67 | § 6,144.64| § 221,207.04
257| D248| Cherry Hill Public Schools 070800 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| S 88,553.22
258| D249 Cinnaminson Township Public Schoo|050840 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | $ 2,451.06 | S 2,52459| §  30,295.10
259| D250(Borough of Clayton Board of Educati{ 150860 Ethernet 300 300 24 7/1/2016 | S 1,799.58 | 1,853.57| S  44,485.62
260| D251 |Clearview Regional High School Distr| 150870 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 99858 | $ 1,028.54| $ 37,027.35
261| D252 | Collingswood Public Schools 070940 Ethernet 700 700 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,202.22 S 3,298.29| S 118,738.32
262| D253 | Deerfield Township School District (111020 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998,58 | § 1,028.54| S  37,027.35
263| D254 | Delanco Township Board of Educatiol051030 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | $ 1,028.54| §  37,027.35
264| D255 | Delsea Regional School District 154940 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | § 1,420.44 | $ 1,463.05| § 52,669.92
265| D256 Deptford Township Schools 151100 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59| §  30,295.10
266| D257 |Downe Township Board of Education111120 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S 998.58 | $ 1,028.54| § 24,684.90
267| D258 |Edgewater Park Township School Dis|051280 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| S 52,669.92
268| D259 |Edgewater Park Township School Dis|051280 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| $ 52,669.92
269| D260 |Egg Harbor Township School District [011310 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | & 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59( S 30,295.10
270| D261)Elk Township School District 151330 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
271| D262 |Elsinboro 331350 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54( S 37,027.35
272| D263 |Evesham Township School District  |051420 Ethernet 500 500 24 7/1/2016 | S 2,451.06 | S 2,524.59| s 60,590.20
273| D264 |Florence Board of Education 051520 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72( §  44,276.61
274| D265 |Galloway Township Public Schools  [011690 Ethernet 150 150 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | 1,463.05| $ 52,669.92
275| D266|Gateway Regional HS District 151715 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| § 88,553.22
276| D267 |Gloucester County Vocational-Techn|151775 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | S 2,451.06 | S 2,524.59| §  90,885.30
277| D268|Gloucester Township Public Schools |071780 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| $ 52,669.92
278| D269 |Greenwich Township Board of Educal 151830 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
279| D270|Haddon Heights School District 071880 Ethernet 300 300 24 7/1/2016 | S 1,799.58 | § 1,853.57| § 44,485.62
280| D271 |Haddon Township School District 071890 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | $ 1,028.54| s 37,027.35
281| D272 |Haddonfield Public Schools 071800 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S 2,451.06 | $ 2,524.59( S 30,295.10
282| D273 |Hainesport Township School District |051910 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54( S 37,027.35
283| D274 |Hamilton Township School District  |011940 Ethernet 200 200 24 7/1/2016 | $ - S -1s -
284| D275 [Harrison Township 152070 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | S 1,028.54 S 37,027.35
285| D276|Holy Cross High School 061060 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54| §  37,027.35
286| D277 |Island Heights 292350 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | § 1,028.54| § 37,027.35
287| D278 [Jackson Board of Education 292360 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25 | § 3,680.72| § 132,829.83
288| D279 |Kingsway Regional School District 152440 Ethernet 250 250 12 7/1/2017 | § 1,799.58 | S 1,853.57| §  22,242.81
289| D280|Kingsway Learning Center-Haddonfig 088264 Ethernet 50 50 36 7/1/2015 | S 709.33 | S 730.61| $§ 26,301.96
290| D281|Lavallette Board of Eduction 292550 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ - S -1 s -
291| D282 |Linwood Public Schools 012680 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
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292| D283|Lower Alloways Creek School District{ 332800 Ethernet 40 40 36 7/1/2015 | $ 709.33 | S 730.61| $  26,301.96
293| D284 |Lumberton School District 052850 Ethernet 500 500 36 7/1/2015 | § 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59| § 90,885.30
294| D285|Manchester Township School Distric{ 292940 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | S 3,582.25 | & 3,689.72| S  44,276.61
295| D286|Mansfield Township School District |052960 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | $ 1,028.54| § 37,027.35
296| D287 |Maple Shade School District 053010 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S  24,684.90
297| D288 |Medford Lakes School District 053070 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | § 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 24,684.90
298| D289|Medford Township Public Schools 053080 Ethernet 50 50 24 7/1/2016 | $ 709.33 | $ 730.61| S 17,534.64
299| D290|Monroe Township Public Schools  |153280 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 |54 3,582.25 [i5 3,689.72| §  44,276.61
300| D291 |Moarestown Township Public School 053360 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | S 3,582.25| § 3,689.72| S 88,553.22
301| D292 | Mount Holly Township Public School{053430 Ethernet 400 400 36 7/1/2015 | § 2,141.34 | S 2,205.58] S 79,400.89
302| D293 |Mount Laurel School Distirct 053440 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S  37,027.35
303| D294 |Mt. Ephraim School District 073420 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S 998.58 | S 1,02854| S 24,684.90
304| D295 |Mullica Township School District 013480 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | § 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| §  52,669.92
305| D296 |New Road Schools of New Jersey/Oc{308347 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 1,420.44 | § 1,463.05| §  52,669.92
306| D297 |North Hanover Twp School District  |053650 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | $ 3,582.25| S 3,689.72| $  44,276.61
307| D298 | Northern Burlington County Regiona|053690 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 12 7/1/2017 | $ 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| S 44,276.61
308| D299 | Northfield Community School 013720 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | & 1,028.54| $ 37,027.35
309] D300|Oaklyn Public School 073770 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54] $ 37,027.35
310| D301 |Ocean City School District 093780 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | $ 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
311] D30210ldmans Township School 333860 Ethernet 100 100 24 7/1/2016 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| $ 24,684.90
312| D303 |Palmyra Borough School District 053920 Ethernet 100 100 12 7/1/2017 | S 998,58 | $ 1,028.54| S 12,342.45
313| D304 [Paulsboro Public Schools 154020 Ethernet 300 300 12 | 7/1/2017 S 1,799.58 | $ 1,853.57| $ 22,242.81
314| D305 | Pennsville School District 334075 Ethernet 400 400 36 7/1/2015 | S 2,141.34 | $ 2,205.58 $  79,400.89
315| D306 |Pine Hill School District 074110 Ethernet 800 800 12 7/1/2017 | $ 3,202.22 | § 3,298.29( $ 39,579.44
316| D307 |Pitman School District 154140 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25 | $ 3,689.72| § 132,829.83
317| D308 | Point Pleasant Beach School District |294220 Ethernet 60 60 36 7/1/2015 | S 709.33 | S 730.61| S 26,301.96
318| D309| Point Pleasant Beach School District [294220 Ethernet 60 60 36 7/1/2015 | S 709.33 | S 730.61( S 26,301.96
319| D310{Point Pleasant Borough Board of Edu294210 Ethernet 200 200 24 7/1/2016 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| §  35,113.28
320| D311|Quinton Township School District  [334280 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S  37,027.35
321| D312 |Rancocas Valley Regional High Schoq 054320 ‘ Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | $ 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| $ 132,829.83
322| D313|Shamong School District 054740 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | $ 2,451.06 | S 2,524.59( $ 30,295.10
323| D314 |South Harrison Township School Dist] 154880 Ethernet 250 250 12 7/1/2017 | S 1,799.58 | S 1,853.57( § 22,242.81
324| D315 |Southampton Township Board of Ed{ 054930 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 24 7/1/2016 | $ 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| S 88,553.22
325| D316|Springfield Township School District 055010 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
326| D317|St Joseph Grade School 301025 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
327| D318|St. Peter School 004220 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
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328| D319|Toms River Regional Schools 295190 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25 | & 3,689.72| S 132,829.83
329| D320|Township of Franklin Public Schools |151590 Ethernet 100 100 36 | 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | § 1,028.54| $ 37,027.35
330| D321 |Township of Franklin Public Schools [151590 Ethernet 100 100 36 | 7/1/2015 | § 998.58 | S 1,028.54| $  37,027.35
331| D322 | Township of Franklin Public Schools |151590 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | § 1,028.54| S  37,027.35
332| D323 |Upper Deerfield Township 115300 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | § 1,028.54| § 37,027.35
333| D324 |Upper Pittsgrove Board of Education|335320 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | $ 1,028.54( §  37,027.35
334| D325|Upper Township School District 095340 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | S 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S  37,027.35
335| D326|Upper Township School District 095340 Ethernet 100 100 36 7/1/2015 | $ 998.58 | S 1,028.54| S 37,027.35
336| D327|Voorhees Township Public Schools |075400 Ethernet 500 500 12 7/1/2017 | S 2,451.06 | § 2,524.59| §  30,295.10
337| D328 |Washington Township Public Schoold 155500 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25 | S 3,689.72| §  132,829.83
338| D329 |Washington Township School Distric{ 055490 Ethernet 200 200 36 7/1/2015 | 1,420.44 | § 1,463.05| $  52,669.92
339| D330 |West Cape May Board of Education |095610 Ethernet 50 50 36 7/1/2015 | $ 709.33 | $ 730.61] S  26,301.96
340| D331|West Deptford BOE 155620 Ethernet 200 200 24 7/1/2016 | S 1,420.44 | S 1,463.05| §  35,113.28
341| D332 | Winslow Township School District  |075820 Ethernet 400 400 36 7/1/2015 | $ 2,141.34 | $ 2,205.58( S  79,400.89
342| D333 |Woodbury City Public Schools 155860 Ethernet 1,000 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 3,582.25 | § 3,689.72| S 132,829.83
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BX | Example School DistrictABC (123456 | Ethernet | 100 | 60 |7/1/2015] S 1,050.60] § 6356130]
Central Region e
B140 |[The Barack Obama Green Charter High School 806033 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2015| S 2,060.00| § 74,160.00
B154 |Franklin Township Board of Education 351610 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2017 | S 2,060.00| § 74,160.00
B155 |Franklin Township School 191600 7/1/2015| S -1 S -

B170 [Keansburg School District 252400 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2015| S 2,060.00| § 74,160.00
B171 |[Keyport Board of Education 252430 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2015| § 2,060.00| § 74,160.00
B174 |Long Branch Board of Education 252770 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2015| S  2,060.00| S 74,160.00
B175 |Manalapan-Englishtown Regional Schools 252920 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2017| S  2,060.00| $ 74,160.00
B176 |Manasquan School District 252930 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2015| S  2,060.00| S 74,160.00
B177 [Marlboro Township Board of Education 253030 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2017 | S 2,060.00| S 74,160.00
B178 |Mercer County Special Services School District 213103 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2015|$  2,060.00| S 74,160.00
B179 |Mercer County Technical Schools 003105 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2017| S  2,060.00| S 74,160.00
B180 |Metuchen School District 233120 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2017|$  2,060.00| S 74,160.00
B199 |Rahway Public School District 394290 Ethernet | 1,000 36 7/1/2015| S  2,060.00| $ 74,160.00
B201 |Red Bank Borough Board of Education 254360 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2015| S 2,060.00| § 74,160.00
B225 |Watchung Hills Regional High School 355550 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2015 | S 2,060.00| § 74,160.00
B228 |Westfield Public Schools 395730 Ethernet 1,000 36 7/1/2017 | S 2,060.00| § 74,160.00



Northeastern Region

B114
B102

B140
B154
B170
B171
B174
B175
B176
B177
B178
B179
B1&0
B199
B201
B225
B228

West Orange Public Schools
South Orange Maplewood Board of Education

The Barack Obama Green Charter High School
Franklin Township Board of Education
Keansburg School District

Keyport Board of Education

Long Branch Board of Education
Manalapan-Englishtown Regional Schools
Manasquan School District

Marlboro Township Board of Education
Mercer County Special Services SchoolL District
Mercer County Technical Schools

Metuchen School District

Rahway Public School District

Red Bank Borough Board of Education
Watchung Hills Regional High School
Westfield Public Schools

No bid
No bid
Significant price difference
Significant price difference
Significant price difference
Significant price difference
Significant price difference
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
Significant price difference
Significant price difference
No bid
Significant price difference



New Jersey Digital Readiness for Learning and Assessment Project- Broad.

Copyright Dellicker Strategies

Attachment 1- Pricing Spreadsheets

Component- Wide Area Network and Internet Cooperative Purchasing Initiative
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4 | AX |District/Organization Name DNS
5 |A1 |Atlantic Highlands School District S 7,941.30
6 |A4 |Berlin Borough School District S 5,345.70
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